

Various Aggregates

Bid Number	6566		
Contract Period	7/1/21 - 11/30/23		
Supplier	Erie Materials	Arms Trucking	Allied Corp.
Vendor #	319	79	832
Contract Number	20210035	20210036	20210037
Contact	Bill Dillon	Brian Bates	Dispatch
Contact Number	419-625-7374	800-362-1343	330-405-4133
MATERIAL	Unit Cost/Ton	Unit Cost/Ton	Unit Cost/Ton
#1 Limestone (M)			\$ 24.10
#4 Limestone (M)			\$ 24.10
#8 Limestone (M)			\$ 25.85
#9 Limestone (M)			\$ 23.30
#57 Limestone (M)			\$ 24.30
#304 Limestone (M)			\$ 18.50
#617 Limestone (M)			\$ 20.05
#411 or #617 Crusher Run	NOT AWARDED		
#601 A	\$ 50.00		
#601 B	\$ 44.00		
#601 C	\$ 40.00		
#601 D	\$ 33.00		
Armor Stone 36" - 48" (18" thick)	\$ 60.00		
Fill Sand (M)			\$ 15.75
Recycled 304 Concrete			\$ 13.75
Recycled No. 1 Concrete			\$ 19.95
#57 Washed Gravel			\$ 21.95
#8 (Pea) Gravel			\$ 23.95
#530 Trap Sand (M) (1mm-.25) (75%.5-1mm)		\$ 39.45	
Pro/Angle-Angular Bunker Sand		\$ 67.00	
Mason Sand			\$ 17.50
Hard Crushed Sandstone Gravel #1 and #2	No bid		
Gravel Boulders 4"-12", average 6" (ODOT Type D)	No bid		
Gravel Boulders 6"-18", average 12" (ODOT Type C)	No bid		
Gravel Boulders 12"-14", average 6" (ODOT Type B)	No bid		
Gravel Boulders 18"-30", average 6" (ODOT Type A)	No bid		

Notes: Allied Corp. minimum delivery is 15 tons

Arms Trucking minimum delivery is 20 tons